
ADDENDA 

COMMITTEE ON PUBLIC SERVICES 
 

Tuesday, September 10, 2024 
 

 
E. New Business Continued 
 
10.   Communication dated August 1, 2024 (received August 27th) requesting 

Commission approval of an addendum to a cooperative agreement 
between the Charter County of Wayne and WCI Contractors, Inc. (of 
Detroit) not to exceed $387,600, through MiDEAL contract No. 00867, to 
remove and reconstruct the Elizabeth Park Loop Return Road in the City 
of Trenton; WCI Contractors, Inc. will subcontract 14.81%/$57,400 to 
Jacklyn Contracting (of Dryden) for earthwork, demolition and site utilities, 
30.73%/$119,100 to Nagle Paving (of Novi) for hot mix asphalt, 
4.77%/$18,500 to PEA Group (of Detroit) for engineering and surveying 
and 0.41%/$1,600 to PK Contracting (of Troy) for pavement markings; the 
term of the addendum will commence upon Commission approval through 
February 6, 2025; the cost of the addendum will be charged to Account 
No. 208 44935 978250 (Park-Millage Capital Improv). (2024-60-041) 

 
Firm:  WCI Contractors, Inc. 
Address: 20210 Conner Street, Detroit, MI 48234 
Contact: Thomas A. Maliszewski III (313) 368-2100 

 
11. Communication dated August 21, 2024 (received September 9th) 

requesting Commission approval of the Michigan Department of 
Transportation (MDOT) Easement and Consent to Grade permit 
agreement to replace and reconstruct a bridge on Ann Arbor Road and 
Newburgh Road in the City of Livonia; the County Executive advises that 
the County will receive $66,150 from MDOT for the easement and consent 
to grade the parcels; the term of the agreement will commence upon 
Commission approval in perpetuity; the cost of the agreement will be 
charged to Account No. 208 44925 673020 (Parks - Millage Operating). 
(2024-60-043) 
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